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Diversey Crew
Disinfectant
Cleaner (SKU
#01102190)

264 Diversey 2 $183.03 | s48319.92 | Diversey 2 $163.60 | $43,19040 | Diversey 2 NoBid 50,00 Diversey 2 $168.00 | 54435200 | Diversey 2 $21232 | $5605248 | Diversey 2 $187.93 | sage1352 | Diversey 2 NoBid 5000

Diversey Stride
Citrus Neutral HC
Cleaner (SKU
#904716)

330 Diversey 2 $17436 | $57,53880 | Diversey 2 $156.24 | $5155920 | Diversey 2 NoBid $0.00 Diversey 2 $15939 | $5259870 | Diversey 2 $21927 | $72359.10 | Diversey 2 $164.80 | $54384.00 | Diversey 2 NoBid 5000

Diversey Glance
NA Cleaner (SKU | 264 Diversey 2 $87.00 | $2299176 | Diversey 2 $8428 | $2224992 | Diversey 2 NoBid $0.00
#100975197)

Diversey 2 $7959 | s2101176 | Diversey 2 $120.97 | $3431208 | Diversey 2 $88.43 | s2334552 | Diversey 2 No Bid s0.00

Diversey
Prominence
Heavy Duty % Diversey 2 $123.98 | $1227402 | Diversey 2 $11082 | $1097118 | Diversey 2 NoBid $0.00
Cleaner (SKU
#94996466)

Diversey 2 $113.90 | $1127610 | Diversey 2 $149.27 | $14777.73 | Diversey 2 $125.90 | 1246410 | Diversey 2 No Bid s0.00

Diversey GP
Forward (SKU 132 Diversey 2 $7952 | $104%64 | Diversey 2 $7102 | s93e78 | Diversey 2 NoBid $0.00
#904965)

Diversey 2 $7275 | $9603.00 | Diversey 2 $107.73 | $1422036 | Diversey 2 $80.76 | $1066032 | Diversey 2 No Bid s0.00

Diversey Revive
Floor Finish (SKU 2 Diversey s $7853 | s235590 | Diversey s $7213 | 5216390 | Diversey s NoBid 50.00
#904636)

Diversey B $7292 | $2187.60 | Diversey H $107.12 | 321360 | Diversey B $7974 | $239220 | Diversey H No Bid $0.00

Total Cost Diversey Products $153,977.04 $139,522.44 NoBid Vendor is not authorized to sell Diversey products $141,029.16 $194,935.35 $152,859.66 No Bid

Notes Awarded Diversey Product As a Group.

SC Johnson Hand
Soap (KU 1200 | sciohnson| 6 $39.50 | $4740000 | SClohnson| 6 $3530 | sa236000 |SClohmson| 6 $3590 | $4308000 |SClohmson| 6 $38.99 | 4678800 |SClohnson| 6 $3481 | sa177200 |SClohmson| 6 $5000 | 6000000 |SClohmson| 6 $6401 | $7681200 |SClohnson| 6 $3515 | se21s000
#AZUIL)

SC Johnson Hand
Sanitizser (SKU 80 Sclohnson| 6 53921 | $313680 | SClohnson| 6 $35.05 | s280400 |SClohmson| 6 $3564 | 285120 |SClohmson| 6 $23.25 | s18000 |SClohnson| 6 $3455 | 276400 |SClohmson| 6 $5250 | $420000 |SClohnson| 6 $49.08 | 392640 |SClohmson| 6 $3487 | sa7evc0
#55857)

Notes $50,536.80 $45,164.00 $45,931.20 $48,648.00 $44,536.00 $64,200.00 $80,738.40 $44,969.60

Notes ‘Awarded SC Johnson Product As a Group




